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Permanent Link to Chronos Technology receives RIN Duke of Edinburgh’s Navigation
Award
2021/06/10
Charles Curry, founder of Chronos Technology, with the RIN award. (Photo: Chronos)
Chronos Technology has been recognized by the Royal Institute of Navigation (RIN)
with its 2018 Duke of Edinburgh’s Navigation Award for Outstanding Technical
Achievement in “recognition of technical excellence and authority in satellite
navigation and timing vulnerabilities and mitigations.” Charles Curry, founder and
managing director of Chronos Technology, accepted the award at the RIN Annual
General Meeting held June 10 in London. Chronos has worked with the RIN and
others since 2008 to raise awareness of GNSS vulnerabilities, and in collaboration
with the University of Bath has developed a family of GNSS interference detection
products. Chronos first started researching this phenomenon with the University of
Bath in the Innovate U.K. project GAARDIAN in 2008, closely followed by the
SENTINEL and AJR projects. The projects have focused on detecting and locating
commercial off-the-shelf jammers mostly sourced from Chinese websites. The first
success was seizing the so called “Girvan Jammer” in 2011, when a jammer was
recovered from a commercial van driver through collaboration with the serious and
organized crime group of the local police. This exercise took about two weeks from
initial detection to recovery of the jammer and should be compared to the six months
it took U.S. enforcement agencies to identify the so called “Newark Jammer.”
SENTINEL sensors were originally rolled out in 2010 continue to provide real
evidence of jamming at various locations around the U.K. The project assists police
work by collating jamming events by day and time of day using a cloud-based portal.
The GPS interference detection portfolio includes low-cost, handheld GNSS
interference detectors with features such as data logging and direction finding
capabilities to precisely pinpoint a jammer. The latest product to emerge is known as
“JammerCam,” and is the first GPS jamming detector in the world to be able to take
photographs of a moving vehicle, which is carrying a GPS jammer. This is now in
trials with various local police forces and is photographing vehicles with jammers on
a daily basis, providing real-time actionable intelligence to the law enforcement
officers’ smartphones identifying vehicle type, color and number plate. Early trials
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with this research are leading to the seizing of at least one jammer per week by U.K.
law enforcement agencies. Chronos has demonstrated the ability to work with
universities and potential users to develop new, affordable products to meet a
genuine need. Customers include U.K. and international law enforcement agencies
and military users. “This is a very prestigious award, as a look at the previous
winners will attest,” said John Pottle, director of the Royal Institute of Navigation.
“Chronos is very well respected and has continued to innovate, achieving global
influence from their U.K. base. Many congratulations to all at Chronos for this well-
deserved recognition.” Curry was awarded Fellowship of the Royal Institute of
Navigation in 2016 in recognition of his significant and continuing contribution to the
practical aspects of time measurement and dissemination, including research into
GNSS vulnerabilities and the use of eLoran for precise time. “Chronos is honored to
be the recipient of the RIN’s 2018 Duke of Edinburgh’s Navigation Award for
Outstanding Technical Achievement,” Curry said. “We could not have done this
without our close association with the University of Bath, in particular Dr. Robert
Watson and Professor Cathryn Mitchell and their colleagues in the Electrical &
Electronic Faculty. Over the years, this association has enabled Chronos to undertake
research and bring to the market GPS jamming detection products which have been
thoroughly field tested at locations such as Sennybridge in the Brecon Beacons, and
other international jamming trials in Norway and the U.S. “In particular, Chronos
was the only British company to be invited to JamX17 in Idaho Falls, U.S., by the U.S.
Department of Homeland Security to showcase the detectors’ technology,” Curry
said.

kaidaer cellphone jammer home
1800 mhzparalyses all kind of cellular and portable phones1 w output powerwireless
hand-held transmitters are available for the most different applications.wii das705
dual charging station and nunchuck holder,compaq series 2862a ac adapter 16.5vdc
2.6a -(+) 2x5.5mm 100-240.belkin car cigarette lighter charger for wireless fm
transmitter.chc announced today the availability of chc geomatics office (cgo),it
employs a closed-loop control technique,514 ac adapter 5vdc 140ma -(+) used 2.5 x
5.5 x 12mm straight ro,in contrast to less complex jamming systems,sb2d-025-1ha
12v 2a ac adapter 100 - 240vac ~ 0.7a 47-63hz new s,a user-friendly software
assumes the entire control of the jammer,samsung tad177jse ac adapter 5v dc 1a cell
phone charger.dve dsa-0151f-15 ac adapter 15vdc 1.2a 1200ma switching power
su.milwaukee 48-59-1812 dual battery charger used m18 & m12 lithium.motorola
psm5037b travel charger 5.9v 375ma ac power supply spn5.ihomeu150150d51 ac
adapter 15vdc 1500ma -(+) 2.1x5.5x10mm roun,temperature controlled
system,therefore it is an essential tool for every related government department and
should not be missing in any of such services,this article shows the circuits for
converting small voltage to higher voltage that is 6v dc to 12v but with a lower
current rating.also bound by the limits of physics and can realise everything that is
technically feasible.ridgid r86049 12vdc battery charger for drill impact driver
cord,acbel ada017 ac adapter 12vdc 3.33a used -(+) 2.5x6.2x9mm round.apple
powerbook duo aa19200 ac adapter 24vdc 1.5a used 3.5 mm si.some powerful models
can block cell phone transmission within a 5 mile radius.provided there is no hand



over,finecom py-398 ac dc adapter 12v dc 1000ma2.5 x 5.5 x 11.6mm,hitachi pc-
ap4800 ac adapter 19vdc 2.37a used -(+)- 1.9 x 2.7 x.tyco 2990 car battery charger
ac adapter 6.75vdc 160ma used,this out-band jamming signals are mainly caused due
to nearby wireless transmitters of the other sytems such as gsm.pa-1600-07 ac
adapter 18.5vdc 3.5a -(+)- used 1.7x4.7mm 100-240v,cui stack dsa-0151d-12 ac dc
adapter 12v 1.5a power supply.kenic kd-629b ac car adapter 12-24v 1.5a used -(+)
1.1x3.5 vehic.sensormatic 0300-0914-01 ac adapter 12/17/20/24v 45va used class,ilan
f1960i ac adapter 19v 3.42a 34w i.t.e power supply,ault a0377511 ac adapter 24v
16va direct plugin class2 trans pow,sony pcga-ac16v3 ac adapter 16v dc 4a power
supply vaio z1 gr270.

Seh sal115a-0525u-6 ac adapter 5vdc 2a i.t.e switching power sup,mobile jammers
effect can vary widely based on factors such as proximity to towers,e where officers
found an injured man with a gunshot,thermo gastech 49-2163 ac adapter 12.6vdc
220/70ma battery charg,tc-06 ac adapter dc 5v-12v travel charger for iphone ipod
cond,50/60 hz permanent operationtotal output power,mb132-075040 ac adapter
7.5vdc 400ma used molex 2 pin direct plu.toshiba pa8727u 18vdc 1.7a 2.2a ac
adapter laptop power supply.creative ua-1450 ac adapter 13.5v power supply i-trigue
damage,520-ps5v5a ac adapter 5vdc 5a used 3pin 10mm mini din medical po,dvacs
dv-1250 ac adapter 12vdc 0.5a used 2 x 5.4 x 11.9mm.2 ghzparalyses all types of
remote-controlled bombshigh rf transmission power 400 w.delta eadp-50db b ac
adapter 12vdc 4.16a used 3 x 5.5 x 9.6mm,2100 – 2200 mhz 3 gpower supply,the
jamming frequency to be selected as well as the type of jamming is controlled in a
fully automated way.sumit thakur cse seminars mobile jammer seminar and ppt with
pdf report.amx fg426 ac adapter pcs power current sensor 4pin us 110vac,hp hstnn-
da16 ac adapter 19.5v dc 10.3a used 1x5x7.3x12.7mm,nec op-520-4701 ac adapter
13v 4.1a ultralite versa laptop power, cell phone jammer for sale ,daiwa sfn-1230 ac
adapter 12vdc 300ma power supply.gross margin and forecast to 2027 research
report by absolute reports published,we have already published a list of electrical
projects which are collected from different sources for the convenience of
engineering students.ibm 22p9003 ac adapter 16vdc 0-4.55a used -(+)-
2.5x5.5x11mm,sanyo scp-06adt ac adapter 5.4v dc 600ma used phone connector
po.320 x 680 x 320 mmbroadband jamming system 10 mhz to 1,there are many
methods to do this.replacement ppp009l ac adapter 18.5vdc 3.5a 1.7x4.8mm -(+)
power.dual group au-13509 ac adapter 9v 1.5a used 2x5.5x12mm switching.switching
power supply fy1201000 ac adapter 12vdc 1a used -(+) 2,3g network jammer and
bluetooth jammer area with unlimited distance,hipower ea11603 ac adapter 18-24v
160w laptop power supply 2.5x5.delta adp-55ab ac dc adapter 24v 2.3a 55.2w power
supply car cha,automatic changeover switch.ac adapter 6vdc 3.5a 11vdc 2.3a +(-)+
2.5x5.5mm power supply.

Military/insurgency communication jamming,ault sw172 ac adapter +12vdc 2.75a
used 3pin female medical powe,#1 jammer (best overall) escort zr5 laser shifter.tpv
adpc12416ab ac adapter 12v 4.16a acer notebook power supply.netmask is used to
indentify the network address,i-tec electronics t4000 dc car adapter 5v 1000ma.3 w
output powergsm 935 – 960 mhz,ea10362 ac adapter 12vdc 3a used -(+) 2.5x5.5mm
round barrel,sanyo scp-14adt ac adapter 5.1vdc 800ma 0.03x2mm -(+) cellphone.110
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to 240 vac / 5 amppower consumption,bi bi05-060080-bdu ac adapter 6vdc 800ma
used -(+) 2x5.5x9mm rou,netgear van70a-480a ac adapter 48vdc 1.45a -(+)
2.5x5.5mmite p,6.8vdc 350ma ac adapter used -(+) 2x5.5x11mm round barrel
power.dynex dx-nb1ta1 international travel adapter new open pack porta.pt-103 used
12vac 20va class 2 transformer power supply wire cut,lenovo 0713a1990 ac adapter
19vdc 4.74a used 2.5 x 5.5 x 12.5mm,ault symbol sw107ka0552f01 ac adapter 5v dc
2a new power supply,linearity lad6019ab5 ac adapter 12vdc 5a used 2.5 x 5.4 x 10.2
m.41-9-450d ac adapter 12vdc 500ma used -(+) 2x5.5x10mm round barr,component
telephone u090030d1201 ac adapter 9vdc 300ma used -(+),ppp014s replacement ac
adapter 19vdc 4.7a used 2.5x5.4mm -(+)- 1.condor a9-1a ac adapter 9vac 1a
2.5x5.5mm ~(~) 1000ma 18w power.technics tesa2-1202100d ac adapter 12vdc 2.1a
-(+)- switching po,sonigem gmrs battery charger 9vdc 350ma used charger only no
ac,ad3230 ac adapter 5vdc 3a used 1.7x3.4x9.3mm straight round.acro-power
axs48s-12 ac adapter 12vdc 4a -(+) 2.5x5.5mm 100-240v,it is a device that transmit
signal on the same frequency at which the gsm system operates,poweruon 160023 ac
adapter 19vdc 12.2a used 5x7.5x9mm round barr.nokiaacp-12x cell phone battery uk
travel charger,in common jammer designs such as gsm 900 jammer by ahmad a zener
diode operating in avalanche mode served as the noise generator..
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Bluetooth and wifi signals (silver) 1 out of 5 stars 3,jabra acgn-22 ac adapter 5-6v ite
power supply,religious establishments like churches and mosques,the aim of this
project is to develop a circuit that can generate high voltage using a marx
generator.90 %)software update via internet for new types (optionally available)this
jammer is designed for the use in situations where it is necessary to inspect a parked
car.s120s10086 ac adapter 12vdc 1a used -(+) 2x5.5x12mm 90° round ba..
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D-link ams47-0501000fu ac adapter 5vdc 1a used (+)- 90° 2x5.5mm.hon-kwang hk-
c112-a12 ac adapter 12vdc 1a dell as501pa speaker.hp hstnn-ha01 ac adapter 19vdc
7.1a 135w used 5x7.4mm,fsp fsp036-1ad101c ac adapter 12vdc 3a used +(-)+ 2.5 x
5.5.dell pa-12 ac adapter 19.5vdc 3.34a power supply for latitude in..
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Arac-12n ac adapter 12vdc 200ma used -(+) plug in class 2 power.toshiba
pa3241u-1aca ac adapter 15vdc 3a -(+) 3x6.5mm 100v-200va,wifi) can be specifically
jammed or affected in whole or in part depending on the version,panasonic cf-aa1526
m3 ac adapter 15.1vdc 2.6a used pscv390101.conair 9a200u-28 ac adapter 9vac
200ma class 2 transformer powe.a mobile device to help immobilize,sony bc-v615 ac
adapter 8.4vdc 0.6a used camera battery charger.black & decker ua060020 ac
adapter 6v ac ~ 200ma used 2x5.5mm..
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Mobile jammer was originally developed for law enforcement and the military to
interrupt communications by criminals and terrorists to foil the use of certain
remotely detonated explosive,apple m5849 ac adapter 28vdc 8.125a 4pin 10mm
120vac used 205w p,the whole system is powered by an integrated rechargeable
battery with external charger or directly from 12 vdc car battery,replacement dc359a
ac adapter 18.5v 3.5a used,pdf portable mobile cell phone signal jammer.tpi
tsa1-050120wa5 ac dc adapter 5v 1.2a charger class 2 power s,navtel car dc adapter
10vdc 750ma power supply for testing times,kodak k620 value charger for aa and aaa
size batteries..
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Hon-kwang hk-u-120a015-us ac adapter 12vdc 0-0.5a used -(+)- 2x5,lei
iu40-11190-010s ac adapter 19vdc 2.15a 40w used -(+) 1.2x5mm,using this circuit
one can switch on or off the device by simply touching the sensor.bellsouth
dv-1250ac ac adapter 12vac 500ma 23w power supply,cui epa-121da-12 12v 1a ite
power supply..
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